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Metes & Bounds Property Description

A tract of land containing 0.2359 Acre (10,275 Square Feet), being Lot 43 of Peach Creek Pines
an unrecorded subdivision out of the C. Bryan Survey, Abstract No. 75 and the S. Garsee Survey,
Abstract No. 229 of Montgomery County, Texas, being part of a tract recorded in the name of
Worley Properties, Inc. in Volume 713, Page 662 of the Real Property Records of Montgomery
County, Texas (R.P.R.M.C.T.), and being more particularly described by metes and bounds as
follows: (Bearings based on Volume 885, Page 552 of the R.P.R.M.C.T.)

COMMENCING at a 1/2 Inch iron rod found at the intersection of the east right-of-way line of
Dorothy Lane (60 Feet wide) and the south right-of-way line of Pine Drive (60 Feet wide);

THENCE, SOUTH 89º 33’ 00” EAST, with said south right-of-way line, a distance of 75.00 Feet
to a point at the northwest corner and POINT OF BEGINNING of this tract from which a 5/8
Inch iron rod found bears North 10º 41’ 39” East, a distance of 1.38 Feet;

THENCE, SOUTH 89º 33’ 00” EAST, continuing with said south right-of-way line, a distance
of 75.00 Feet to a 1/2 Inch iron rod with a "PRECISION" cap set at the northeast corner of this
tract (from which an iron rod found at Dorston Street (60 Feet wide) bears South 89º 33’ 00” East,
a distance of 900.00 Feet, from said iron rod found a 3/4 Inch iron pipe found at Peach Drive
bears South 00º 27’ 00” East, a distance of 274.00 Feet, from said 3/4 Inch pipe found a second
iron rod found bears North 89º 33' 00" West, a distance of 75.00 Feet);

THENCE, SOUTH 00º 27’ 00” WEST, with the west line of Lot 42, as recorded in the name of
the Estate of Cordis Bolen, a distance of 137.00 Feet to a 1/2 Inch iron rod with a "PRECISION"
cap set at the northwest corner of Lot 70 as recorded in the name of Edgar P. Torres under
Document No. 2007-116447 of the R.P.R.M.C.T., being the southeast corner of this tract;

THENCE, NORTH 89º 33’ 00” WEST, with the north line of Lot 69, as recorded in the name
of Mrs. Ana Doliz Gomez under Document No. 2014031182 of the R.P.R.M.C.T., a distance of
75.00 Feet to a point at the northeast corner of Lot 68 as recorded in the name of Edgar P. Torres
under Document No. 2007-116447 of the R.P.R.M.C.T., being the southwest corner of this tract
from which a 1/2 Inch iron rod found bears South 43º52’ 00” East, a distance of 1.03 Feet;

THENCE, NORTH 00º 27’ 00” EAST, with the east line of Lot 44, as recorded in the name of
the Jose Salvador Hidalgo Montes under Document No. 2020023650, being further described
under Document No. 9880492 of the R.P.R.M.C.T., a distance of 137.00 Feet to the POINT OF
BEGINNING and containing 0.2359 Acre.
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